¢ Melissa Lee, C.P.M.,A.P.P. Chris Lax, CPSM
Purchasing Agent Assistant Purchasing Agent

November 30, 2022

Car Concepts Commercial, LLC d/b/a/Blagg Tire Wholesale
604 S Main St, Grapevine, TX 76051
terry.kozich@blaggtire.com

Re: RFB NO. 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from March 13, 2023, through March 12,
2024.

X Yes, Blagg Tire Wholesale will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts
through the renewal period. Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.

0 No, Blagg Tire Wholesale will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts
through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? O Yes X No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,
Rrgatzl Fardbay Porry L asnard
J J J J
Krystal Garibay Name: _Perry | eonard
Senior Buyer
(P) 817.884.1133 (P) _817 454 4183
(F) 817.884.1133
(E) kgaribay@tarrantcountytx.gov (F)

(E) __pleanard@carconceptsinc.com




°
°®

TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

*
Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation,

policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.
Bid No. 2021-056 - Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes

Project/Regulation Name:
for Passenger Vehicles and Equipment - Countywide - Various Vendors - Exercise Second and
Final Option for Renewal - Same Firm Fixed Prices and Discount from List Price
County Department: PURCHASING
Contact Person: Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.
Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-3245
Type of TIA Performed: (SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in
Sections Il and Il below.

Stated Purpose
Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline,

court resolution, or order.

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn

Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should
be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney’s Office.

Potential Effect on Private Real Property

.
Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation, or dedication of real

1.
property?
Yes No \

Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially, or

temporarily?
Yes No \
If you answered yes to either question, go to Section Ill. If you answered no to both, STOP

HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.

nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnn




p7)a{ Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P. Chris Lax, CPSM
%." Purchasing Agent Assistant Purchasing Agent

November 30, 2022

Rick's Tire Services Inc.
3004 E Abram St, Arlington, TX 76010
ricktireservice@aol.com

Re: RFB NO. 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from March 13, 2023, through March 12,
2024.

M Yes, Rick's Tire Services Inc. Will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts
through the renewal period. Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.

0O No, Rick's Tire Services Inc. Will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and
discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? 0 Yes O No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Royetzl Fescae i we-

J J J

Krystal Garibay Name: _Dewanne Lo tnm
Senior Buyer
(P) 817.884.1133 (P) _ 3NN -byo - LAv L
(F) 817.884.1133
(E) kgaribav@tarrantcountyix.gov (F) L= NS - ¥ L

(E) (\TL\A*‘:!'-( Be ~o T D aol\. (> ~~




Memorandum

To: Joylee Russell

Dept: Transportation

From: Krystal Garibay Sr. Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: 12/14/2022

Re: Renewal of 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

The above referenced contract will expire on 3/12/23. This contract included
two (2) options to renew with the vendor for additional twelve (12) month
terms. The second renewal term would commence 3/13/23 and would expire
3/112/24

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the
vendor listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate
item and email this form back to me.

Blagg Tire Wholesale, Car Concepts s Commercial, LLC, d/b/a Blagg Tire
Wholesale, & Rick’s Tire Service, Inc.

X Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the second renewal term of the contract.

Funds to support this contract will be provided by the following accounts:

No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: Joylee Russell DATE: 01/06/2023




Memorandum

To:  Keith Carpenter

Dept: Precinct One Maintenzn:e

From: Krystal Garibay Sr. Buyer, {*urchasing Department
Date: 12/14/2022

Re: Renewal of 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

The above referenced contract will expire on 3/12/23. This contract included
two (2) options to renew with !iv: vendor for additional twelve (12) month
terms. The second renewal t¢rrzvould commence 3/13/23 and would expire
3/12/24 -
If you wish to exercise this option io renew and continue this contract with the
vendor listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate
item and email this form back to me.

Blagg Tire Wholesale, Car Conce“pts s Commercial, LLC, d/b/a Blagg Tire
Wholesale, & Rick's Tire Service, Inc.

X ___Yes, | wish to continue the rurrent contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the second rein~:val term of the contract.

Y s

Funds to support this contract v.Arill“be provided by the following accounts:

No, [ do not wish to conﬁnﬁe the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: ﬁ\%}x Qm‘\_\&/ DATE: 1 /L€ [0



Memorandum

To:  Jason Murphy

Dept: Precinct Two Maintenance

From: Krystal Garibay Sr. Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: 12/14/2022

Re: Renewal of 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

The above referenced contract will expire on 3/12/23. This contract included
two (2) options to renew with the vendor for additional twelve (12) month
terms. The second renewal term would commence 3/13/23 and would expire
3/12/24

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the
vendor listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate

item and email this form back to me.

Blagg Tire Wholesale, Car Concepts s Commercial, LLC, d/b/a Blagg Tire
Wholesale, & Rick’s Tire Service, Inc.

Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the second renewal term of the contract.

Funds to support this contract will be provided by the following accounts:

No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: VQ&:«% 7//24% oate: /4¢3



Memorandum

To: Ed Haidusek

Dept: Precinct Three Maintenance

From: Krystal Garibay Sr. Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: 12/14/2022

Re: Renewal of 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

The above referenced contract will expire on 3/12/23. This contract included
two (2) options to renew with the vendor for additional twelve (12) month
terms. The second renewal term would commence 3/13/23 and would expire
3/12/24

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the
vendor listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate
item and email this form back to me.

Blagg Tire Wholesale, Car Concepts s Commercial, LLC, d/b/a Blagg Tire
Wholesale, & Rick’s Tire Service, Inc.

Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the second renewal term of the contract.

Funds to support this contract will be provided by the following accounts:

V2O | SsR1<

No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

N
SIGNATUR%(MW )‘3




Memorandum

To: Ned Pyle

Dept: Precinct Four Maintenance

From: Krystal Garibay Sr. Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: 12/14/2022

Re: Renewal of 2021-056 TIRES AND TUBES FOR PASSENGER
VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

The above referenced contract will expire on 3/12/23. This contract included
two (2) options to renew with the vendor for additional twelve (12) month
terms. The second renewal term would commence 3/13/23 and would expire
3/12/24

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the
vendor listed below for twelve more months, please check the appropriate
item and email this form back to me.

Blagg Tire Wholesale, Car Concepts s Commercial, LLC, d/b/a Blagg Tire
Wholesate, & Rick’s Tire Service, Inc.

,'/” Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor for the second renewal term of the contract.

Funds to support this contract will be provided by the following accounts:

A ‘7/036@@@3/539@25/ 2000 - 2023

No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-
mentioned vendor for the following reason(s).

A

A

N > } S ]
SIGNATURE: "\ \edl. 4 Lﬁk&f DATE: |-18-23




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles

and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*LT Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &

Service

Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description Bt dnit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section A: Tires, Passenger, Radial, All
Season Tread, Polyester, Steel Belts,
Standard Load Range S1
P185/70R14, Goodyear Integrity ‘
1 |#407-476374 or approved equal 5 $55.00|  $275.00 $35.00|  $175.00 $35.00]  $175.00
Brand and Part No. Bid GY Assurance AS Westlake 24235025 Westlake 24235025
P215/70R15, Goodyear Integrity
2 #402-282047 or approved equal g §51.45|  $257.25|  $48.86|  $244.30|  $48.86|  $244.30
) GY Integrity .
P .B 02-2820
Brand and Part No. Bid GY 4 87 402282047 GY Integrity 402282047

*LT Gibson Enterprises, LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &Service did not meet specifications for failure to provide bids on all items listed as

required.

**The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specifications due to exceptions taken to minimum insurance terms and
conditions and for failure to provide bids on all items listed as required. -
**T&W Tire did not meet specifications for failure to provide the brand name of tires bid as required.




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles

and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale

Alternate #2

Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section A: Tires, Passenger, Radial, All
Season Tread, Polyester, Steel Belts,
Standard Load Range S1
P185/70R 14, Goodyear Integrity .
1 #407-476374 or approved equal 5 $35.00 $175.00 $61.45 $307.25] No Bid
; Continental Gen. Altimax
Brand and Part No. Bid| Westlake 24235025 RT43 15494890000 N/A
P215/70R15, Goodyear Integrity i
2 |#402-282047 or approved equal ® $48.86|  $244.30 $69.10)  $345.50 $49.58|  $247.90

Brand and Part No. Bid

GY Integrity 402282047

Continental Gen. Altimax
RT43 15495060000

Goodyear Integrity




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

SECONDARY

Rick's Tire Service, inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

HHT&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Ext.

— Desoription Est. U/71t E>.<t. U.mt E?<t. Unit
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section A: Tires, Passenger, Radial, All
Season Tread, Polyester, Steel Belts,
Standard Load Range S1
P185/70R14, Goodyear Integrity
1 1#407-476374 or approved equal 2 $55.00|  $275.00 $35.00]  $175.00 $57.51|  $287.55
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 407-476374 | Zenna #GL1951327485 04910
P215/70R15, Goodyear Integrity
2 |#402-282047 or approved equal S bo:08| 547,90 $67.00]  $335.00 $66.75|  $333.75
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 402-282047 Firestone #014910 33471




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*LT Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &
Service
Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description Est. Unit EXt. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
P235/70R16XL, UTQG: 520AB e
3 |Firestone Destination LE2 #097-759,| 5 $125.64 $628.20 $105.93 $529.65 $82.39 $411.95
or approved equal
. | Firestone DestinationLE3| Firestone Destination
Brand and Part No. Bid 005338 LE2 GY Assure 407866374
Section B: Tires, Police, Radial,
Conventional Tread, Blackwall, Polyester,
Steel Belts
P235/55R17, UTQG:340AA-A
4 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 98W #732- 10 $122.11 $1,221.10 $100.93| $1,009.30 $102.93( $1,029.30
002-005 or approved equal
. GY EAG RSA Gen GM Justice GY EAG RSA
Brand and Part No. Bid 232002500 1555394 732002500
P265/60R17, UTQG: 340AA o
5 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 108V 200 $135.79| $27,158.00 $110.74| $22,148.00 $112.93| $22,586.00
#732-523-500 or approved equal
. GY EAG RSA Gen GM Justice GY EAG RSA
Brand and Part No. Bid 732523500 1555395 232623500




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Brand and Part No. Bid

732523500

156553960000

- Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext
Descript ) .
Item escription Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
P235/70R16XL, UTQG: 520AB
3 |Firestone Destination LE2 #097-759,| 5 $105.93 $529.65 $126.00 $630.00 $82.44 $412.20
or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid Flrestone]-g;stmatlon General Goodyear Assurance All
Section B: Tires, Police, Radial,
Conventional Tread, Blackwall, Polyester,
Steel Belts
P235/55R17, UTQG:340AA-A
4 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 98W #732- 10 $102.93( $1,029.30 $108.96| $1,089.60 $104.00( $1,040.00
002-005 or approved equal
. GY EAG RSA General G Max Justice
Brand and Part No. Bid 732002500 15553940000 Goodyear Eagle RS-A
P265/60R17, UTQG: 340AA
5 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 108V 200 $112.93| $22,586.00 $120.91| $24,182.00 $115.00( $23,000.00
#732-523-500 or approved equal
GY EAG RSA General G Max Justice

Goodyear Eagle RS-A




SECONDARY

Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

**T&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB-No COOP- Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Descflafion Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
P235/70R16XL, UTQG: 520AB
3 |Firestone Destination LE2 #097-759,| 5 $82.44 $412.20 $104.00 $520.00 $94.01 $470.05
or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 407-866374 Firestone #005338 29909
Section B: Tires, Police, Radial,
Conventional Tread, Blackwall, Polyester,
Steel Belts
P235/55R17, UTQG:340AA-A
4 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 98W #732- 10 $104.00| $1,040.00 $108.00| $1,080.00 $100.00{ $1,000.00
002-005 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 732-002-005 Lol 29901

#003874 or #011687

P265/60R17, UTQG: 340AA

5 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 108V 200

#732-523-500 or approved equal

$115.00| $23,000.00

$121.00| $24,200.00

$116.00| $23,200.00

Brand and Part No. Bid

Goodyear 732-523-500

Firestone
#011685 or 023189

88590




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes.f'or Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*L T Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &
Service
Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts

Commercial, LLC d/b/a

Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description S8 Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
P275/55R20 Firestone Firehawk
6 |Pursuit V-Rated 20 $411.34| $8,226.80| $134.93 $2,698.60 $134.93| $2,698.60
#008921 or approved equal
. . - GY EAG Enfo
No. Bid SF 00892
Brand and Part No. Bl FS Firehawk 1 232010563 GY EAG Enf 732010563
P245/55R18, UTQG: 260AA
7 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 103V 100 $142.00| $14,200.00 $112.93| $11,293.00 $112.93| $11,293.00
#732-026-500 or approved equal
. GY EAG ESA GY EAG RSA
Brand and Part No. Bid|GY EAG ESA 732026500 232026500 232026500




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2 -
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Brand and Part No. Bid

732026500

15553950000

ltem Desaription Est.|  Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
i Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
P275/55R20 Firestone Firehawk
6 |Pursuit V-Rated 20 $163.93| $3,278.60 $175.00f $3,500.00 $136.00| $2,720.00
#008921 or approved equal e
. ; General G Max Justice
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Firehawk 008921 15590810000 Goodyear Eagle Enforcer
P245/55R18, UTQG: 260AA
7 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 103V 100 $112.93| $11,293.00 $126.42| $12,642.00 $116.00] $11,600.00
#732-026-500 or approved equal
GY EAG RSA’ General G Max Justice

Goodyear Eagle RS-A




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

SECONDARY

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

***T&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

It Dasaiitoh Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
e i Qty.| Price Price Price Price Price Price
P275/55R20 Firestone Firehawk .
6 |Pursuit V-Rated 20 $121.75| $2,435.00 $161.00| $3,220.00 $136.80] $2,736.00
#008921 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone 008921 Firestone #008921 10867
P245/55R18, UTQG: 260AA
7 |Goodyear Eagle RS-A 103V 100 $116.00| $11,600.00 $127.00| $12,700.00 $130.35{ $13,035.00
#732-026-500 or approved equal .
’ ; Firestone
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 732-026-500 #000177 or #000702 78864




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*LT Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &
Service
Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts

Commercial, LLC d/b/a

Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

or approved Equal

ltem Descriotion Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
P Qty.| Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section C: Tires, Light Truck, Radial, All
Season Tread, Blackwall, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range As Indicated
LT255/75R16, Load Range E,
8 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-760 5 $132.05 $660.25 $105.93 $529.65 $109.93 $549.65
or approved equal . #
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 002760 | Gen Grab HD 0450716 | GY Wrg HT 744830900
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10
9 |Firestone Transforce HT 40 $154.03| $6,161.20| $110.73| $4,429.20 $110.73| $4,429.20
#107 191-316 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid FS Trans HT2 GY Fort HT 179469622 | GY Fortitude 179469622
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10,
10 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-761 | 40 $133.80( $5,352.00 $106.86| $4,274.40 $113.93{ $4,557.20

Brand and Part No. Bid

FS Trans HT 002761

Gen Grab HD 0457180

GY Wrg HT 744395900




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

- Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext
I Description ‘
Ll P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section C: Tires, Light Truck, Radial, All
Season Tread, Blackwall, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range As Indicated
LT255/75R16, Load Range E,
- 8 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-760 5 $108.93 $544.65 $101.96 $509.80 $107.00 $535.00
or approved equal
. General Grabber HD Goodyear Wrangler
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 002760 04507160000 Eortitude
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10
9 |Firestone Transforce HT 40 $123.93| $4,957.20 $121.87| $4,874.80 $111.00{ $4,440.00
#107 191-316 or approved equal .
; General Grabber HD Goodyear Wrangler
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 191316 04507210000 Eortitude
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10,
10 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-761 | 40 $106.86( $4,274.40 $110.16] $4,406.40 $110.00| $4,400.00
or approved Equal

Brand and Part No. Bid

FS Trans HT 002761

General Grabber HD
04507180000

Goodyear Wrangler
Fortitude




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires a

and Equipment

SECONDARY

nd Tubes for Passenger Vehicles

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

HTRW Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description Est.|  Unit Ext, Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section C: Tires, Light Truck, Radial, All
Season Tread, Blackwall, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range As Indicated
LT255/75R16, Load Range E,
8 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-760 5 $107.00 $535.00 $106.00 $530.00 $131.14 $655.70
or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 179-748-622 Firestone #002760 93775
L T245/75R 16, Load Range E10
9 |Firestone Transforce HT 40 $111.00| $4,440.00 $122.00f $4,880.00 $146.94| $5,877.60
#107 191-316 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 179-469-622 Firestone #002767 69928
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10,
10 |Firestone Transforce HT #002-761 | 40 $110.00| $4,400.00 $103.00 $4,120.00 $127.19] $5,087.60
or approved Equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 179-747-622 Firestone #002761 05485




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires a

and Equipment

nd Tubesv for Passenger Vehicles

Grapevine, TX

PRIMARY ALTERNATE
“LT Gibson Enterprises, Car Concepts . Car Goneep's
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire & |Commercial, LLC d/b/a Dmmere el LLC dibia
. . Blagg Tire Wholesale
Service Blagg Tire Wholesale Altstnate #1
Fort Worth, TX.

Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

or approved equal

- Description Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
LT245/75R17, Load Range E
11 |Firestone Transforce HT 50 $179.84| $8,992.00 $118.73| $5,936.50 $122.93| $6,146.50
#002-777or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 002777 | Gen Grab HD 0457220 | GY Fortitude 179236622
LT265-75R 16, Load Range E10
12 |Firestone Transforce HT #000-182 5 $162.76 $813.80 $124.73 $623.65 $127.93 $639.65

Brand and Part No. Bid

FS Trans HT 000182

Gen Grab HD 0457190

GY Fortitude 179746620

Section D: Tires, Medium Trucks/Bus,
Conventional Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as Indicated

13

Brand and Part No. Bid

N/A

138179739

11R - 22.5, Load Range H16
Firestone FS-561 Plus #248-324, or | 5 No Bid $265.23| $1,326.15 $265.23| $1,326.15
approved equal

GY Mar RSS

GY Mar SS 13879739




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Brand and Part No. Bid

FS FS561 248324

05122920000

ltem Description Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
LT245/75R17, Load Range E .
11 |Firestone Transforce HT 50 $128.93| $6,446.50 $125.00{ $6,250.00 $125.00| $6,250.00
#002-777or approved equal
. General Grabber HD .
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 002777 04507200000 Goodyear Fortitude HT 1
LT265-75R 16, Load Range E10
12 |Firestone Transforce HT #000-182 5 $136.93 $684.65 $125.71 $628.55 $128.00 $640.00
or approved equal .
; General Grabber HD Goodyear Wrangler
Brand and Part No. Bid| FS Trans HT 000182 04507190000 Eortitude
Section D: Tires, Medium Trucks/Bus,
Conventional Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as Indicated
11R - 22.5, Load Range H16 o
13 |Firestone FS-561 Plus #248-324, or | 5 $321.93| $1,609.65 $285.00f $1,425.00 $265,68| $1,328.40
approved equal
General RA

Goodyear Marathon RTD




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

SECONDARY

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

***T&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB-No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Item Description ot U'."t E).d' U.rut E?(t' —— Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
LT245/75R17, Load Range E
11 [|Firestone Transforce HT 50 $125.00| $6,250.00 $125.00] $6,250.00 $146.94| $7,347.00
#002-777or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 179-236-620 Firestone #002777 69928
LT265-75R16, Load Range E10
12 |Firestone Transforce HT #000-182 5 $128.00 $640.00 $129.00 $645.00 $137.46 $687.30
or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 179-746-620 Firestone #002762 01665
Section D: Tires, Medium Trucks/Bus,
Conventional Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as Indicated
11R - 22.5, Load Range H16
13 [|Firestone FS-561 Plus #248-324, or | 5 $265.68| $1,328.40 $303.00 $1,515.00 $280.00{ $1,400.00
approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 138179739 Firestone #156558 03285




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles

and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*LT Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &
Service
Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

Est.

Description
P Qty.

Iltem

Unit
Price

Ext.
Price

Unit Ext.
Price Price

Unit
Price

Ext.
Price

Section E: Tires, Medium Truck/Bus, Mud
and Snow Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as indicated

11R - 22.5, Load Range G14
Firestone FD-663, Extra Deep Drive,
#11-225 or approved equal

14 50

$338.94

$16,947.00

$304.93| $15,246.50

$319.69

$15,984.50

Brand and Part No. Bid

FS FD663 281042

FS FD553 11225

GY G622 138307265

Section F: Tires, Smooth Compactor and
Roller, Tube or Tubeless Type Nylon

7.50 - 15 (TT), 12 Ply Compactor
Tube Type, Load Range F12, 5
Carlisle #60127 or approved equal

15

$167.00

$835.00

$145.00 $725.00

$145.00

$725.00

Brand and Part No. Bid

Carlisle 60127

Carlisle RR 60127

Carlisle 60127

Total Amount of Bid:

$91,727.60

$71,188.90

$72,796.00

Delivery Time (ARO)

5 Days

1-2 Days

1-2 Days




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment '

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP -Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

ltem Description Eal. Uf"t Efd- Uplt - Ext. Unit Ext.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section E: Tires, Medium Truck/Bus, Mud
and Snow Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as indicated
11R - 22.5, Load Range G14 ,
14 |Firestone FD-663, Extra Deep Drive, [ 50 $304.93| $15,246.50 $309.00| $15,450.00 $301.00| $15,050.00
#11-225 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid|  FS FD663 11225 General HE Goodvear Marathon RTD
05210950000 y :
Section F: Tires, Smooth Compactor and
Roller, Tube or Tubeless Type Nylon
7.50 - 15 (TT), 12 Ply Compactor
15 |Tube Type, Load Range F12, 5 $145.00 $725.00 $205.00f $1,025.00{ No Bid
Carlisle #60127 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid Carlisle 30127 RR BKT Compactor N/A
Total Amount of Bid: $73,624.40 $77,265.90 $71,663.50
Delivery Time (ARO) 1-2 Days Next Day 1-2 Days




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles

and Equipment

SECONDARY

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

HT&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes | HUB-No COOP - Yes
L Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext
[tem Description . . :
P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Section E: Tires, Medium Truck/Bus, Mud
and Snow Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless,
Minimum Load Range as indicated
11R - 22.5, Load Range G14
14 |Firestone FD-663, Extra Deep Drive,| 50 $301.00| $15,050.00 $320.00| $16,000.00 $330.40( $16,520.00
#11-225 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid| Goodyear 138803824 Firestone #009056 94556
Section F: Tires, Smooth Compactor and
Roller, Tube or Tubeless Type Nylon
7.50 - 15 (TT), 12 Ply Compactor
16 |Tube Type, Load Range F12, 5 $159.00 $795.00 $143.00 $715.00 $168.00 $840.00
Carlisle #60127 or approved equal
Brand and Part No. Bid Carlisle 60127 Cralisle #CA60127 60128
Total Amount of Bid: $72,448.50 - $76,885.00 $79,477.55
. . 1-3 Days In Stock
T
Dellzeny: Time §ARD) T8y 3-5 Days in Warehouse & Days




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE

*LT Gibson Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a Ace Tire &
Service
Fort Worth, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Grapevine, TX

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #1
Grapevine, TX

HUB - Yes COOP - No

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

e Description Est. Upit E?<t. Ur-1it E>.<t. U{wit Ef(t.
Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price

Discounts Offered on Tires Not Listed
Auto Tires 0% Conti/General 49% Goodyear 45%
Light Truck/Recreational 0% Conti/General 49% Goodyear 45%
Light Truck Bias 0% Conti/General 49% Goodyear 0%
g;;;mercial Over-the-road Truck 0% Conti/General 28.5% Goodyear 60%
Agriculture Tires 0% Conti/General 0% Goodyear 0%
Specialty Tires 0% Conti/General 0% Goodyear 0%
Off-the-Road Tires 0% Conti/General 0% Goodyear 24%
Tubes 0% Conti/General 0% 0%
Related Items 5% 0% 0%




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

Car Concepts
Commercial, LLC d/b/a
Blagg Tire Wholesale
Alternate #2
Grapevine, TX

Conlan Tire Co., LLC
Fort Worth, TX

**The Goodyear Tire and
Rubber Company
Akron, OH

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

It Description st Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
em P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Discounts Offered on Tires Not Listed '
General 63.25% Pursuit
. 0, 0,
Auto Tires BFS 20% 49% Other Auto Goodyear 45%
Light Truck/Recreational BFS 20% General 49% Goodyear 45%
Light Truck Bias BFS 20% General 49% Goodyear 45%
Cpmmercial Over-the-road Truck General 49% Goodyear 60%
Tires
Agriculture Tires BFS 23% No Bid 0%
Specialty Tires No Bid 0%
Off-the-Road Tires BFS 37% . . No Bid Goodyear 24%
Tubes BFS 0% No Bid 0%
Related ltems No Bid 0%




Bid No. 2021-056 Annual Contract for Tires and Tubes for Passenger Vehicles
and Equipment

SECONDARY

Rick's Tire Service, Inc.
Arlington, TX

Southern Tire Mart
Columbia, MS

***T&W Tire
Fort Worth, TX

HUB -No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

HUB - No COOP - Yes

item Description Est, Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
P Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
Discounts Offered on Tires Not Listed
; Bridgestone 20% ,
[¢)
Auto Tires Goodyear 45% Firestone 20% Mo Bid
Light Truck/Recreational Goodyear 45% No Bid No Bid
Light Truck Bias Goodyear 45% No Bid No Bid
Cpmmercnal Over-the-road Truck Goodyear 60% No Bid No Bid
Tires
Agriculture Tires 0% Firestone 23% No Bid
Specialty Tires 0% No Bid No Bid
Off-the-Road Tires Goodyear 24% No Bid No Bid
Tubes 0% 20% No Bid
Related Iltems 0% 0% No Bid






